297

CH. 272] LAWS OF THE FIFTY-EIGHTH GENERAL ASSEMBLY

CHAPTER 272

COMPENSATION OF CITY COUNCILMEN
H. F. 211

AN ACT to amend section three hundred sixty-three B point nine (363B.9), Code 1958,

relating to compensation of mayor and councilmen in certain cities with a popula-
tion in excess of fifteen thousand (15,000).

Be It Enacted by the General Assembly of the State of Iowa:

1

2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9

N R WNM SULRWNE UL WD~

SECTION 1. Section three hundred sixty-three B point nine
(363B.9), Code 1958, is hereby amended as follows:

1. By striking the words “eighty-three hundred” from line four (4)
in subsection five (5) and inserting in lieu thereof the words ‘‘ten
thousand eight hundred”; and further amending said subsection by
striking from line five (5) the words “seven thousand” and inserting
in lieu thereof the words “nine thousand five hundred”.

2. By striking the words “nine thousand” from line three (3) of
subsection six (6) and inserting in lieu thereof the words “eleven
thousand three hundred’”’; and further amending said subsection by
striking from lines four (4) and five (5) the words “seventy-eight
hundred” and inserting in lieu thereof the words ‘“ten thousand”.

SEC. 2. Section three hundred sixty-three B point nine (363B.9),
Code 1958, is further amended by striking the words “six thousand”
in lines three (3) and four (4) of subsection two (2) and inserting
in lieu thereof the words ‘‘seventy-five hundred” ; also by striking the
words “five thousand” in line five (5) of said subsection and inserting
in lieu thereof the words “sixty-five hundred”.

SEC. 8. Section three hundred sixty-three B point nine (363B.9),
Code 1958, is further amended by striking the words “seven thousand”
in line four (4) of subsection three (3) and inserting in lieu thereof
the words “eighty-five hundred” ; also by striking the words “six thou-
sand” in line five (5) of said subsection and inserting in lieu thereof
the words ‘‘seventy-five hundred”.

SEC. 4. The salaries of the mayor and councilmen may be increased
in accordance with this Act immediately upon the effective date hereof,
anything in section three hundred sixty-eight A point twenty-one
(368({\.21) of the Code or any other statute to the contrary notwith-
standing.

SEC. 5. This Act being deemed of immediate importance shall be
in force and effect immediately upon its passage and publication in the
Cedar Rapids Gazette, a newspaper published at Cedar Rapids, Iowa,
and in the Marion Sentinel, a newspaper published at Marion, Iowa.

Approved April 27, 1959.

I hereby certify that the foregoing Act, House File 271, was published in the Cedar
Rapids Gazette, Cedar Rapids, Iowa, April 29, 1959, and in the Marion Sentinel,
Marion, Iowa, May 6, 1959.

MELVIN D. SYNHORST, Secretary of State.



