
Tax Reduction V V ' House File No. 21 

-Committee bill *^>~ / Senate File No. 21^ 

Reducing statutory salaries of county officers. 

A BILL FOR 
An Act to amend sections fifty-one hundred twenty-five (5125), fifty-two hun- ( 

dred twenty (5220), fifty-two hundred twenty-one (5221), fifty-two hun

dred twenty-two (5222), fifty-two hundred twenty-three (5223), fifty-two 

hundred twenty-four (5224), fifty-two hundred twenty-five (5225), fifty-

two hundred twenty-six (5226), fifty-two hundred twenty-seven (5227), 

fifty-two hundred twenty-eight (5228), fifty-two hundred twenty-nine 

(5229), fifty-two hundred thirty (5230), fifty-two hundred thirty-one 

(5231), fifty-two hundred thirty-two (5232), fifty-five hundred seventy-

one (5571), fifty-five hundred seventy-two (5572), fifty-five hundred sev

enty-three (5573) and fifty-six hundred sixty-nine (5669), code 1931, to 

revise statutory salary rates of county officers, their deputies and clerks. 

Be It Enacted by the General Assembly of the State of Iowa: 

1 Section 1. (Supervisors.) Amend section fifty-one hundred 

2 twenty-five (5125), code 1931, by striking from line three (3) 

3 the word " f ive" and substituting therefor the word " fou r . " 

4 Further amend said section by striking from line four 

5 (4) the word " f ive" and substituting therefor the word " fou r . " 

1 Sec. 2. (County Auditor.) Amend section fifty-two hundred 

2 twenty (5220), code 1931, by striking from paragraph one (1), 

3 line one (1), the words "seventeen hundred" and substituting 

4 therefor the words ' ' one thousand five hundred thirty. ' ' 

5 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

6 two (2) line two (2) the words "eighteen hundred" and substituting 

7 therefor the words "one thousand six hundred twen ty" 

8 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 



— 2 — 

9 three (3), line two (2), the words "nineteen hundred" and sub-

10 stituting therefor the words "one thousand seven hundred t e n " 

11 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

12 four (4) line two (2) the words " two thousand" and substituting 

13 therefor the words "eighteen hundred" 

11 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

15 five (5) line two (2) the words "twenty-one hundred" and sub-

16 stituting therefor the words "one thousand eight hundred thirty-

17 five" 

18 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

19 six (6) line two (2) the words "twenty-two hundred" and sub-

20 stituting therefor the words "one thousand eight hundred seventy" 

21 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

22 seven (7) line two (2) the words "twenty-four hundred" and sub-

23 stituting therefor the words " two thousand for ty" 

24 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

25 eight (8) line two (2) the words "twenty-eight hundred" and sub-

26 stituting therefor the words " two thousand four hundred eighty" 

27 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

28 nine (9) line two (2) the words "three thousand" and substituting 

29 therefor the words " two thousand five hundred fifty" 

30 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

31 ten (10), line two (2) the words "thirty-three hundred" and sub-

32 stituting therefor the words " two thousand eight hundred five" 

33 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph eleven 

34 (11) lines one (1) and two (2) the words "thirty-four hundred" 



— 3 — 

35 and substituting therefor the words " two thousand eight hundred 

36 ninety". 

1 Sec. 3. (Deputy Auditor and Clerk.) Amend section fifty -

2 two hundred twenty-one (5221), code 1931, by striking from para-

3 graph one (1), line three (3), the words "fifteen hundred ' ' and 

4 substituting therefor the words "fourteen hundred." 

5 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

6 two (2), line five (5), the words "seventeen hundred fifty" and 

7 substituting therefor the words ' ' one thousand five hundred 

8 sevienty-five." 

9 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

10 two (2) line ten (10) the words "fifteen hundred" and substi-

11 tuting therefor the words ' ' fourteen hundred. ' ' 

1 Sec. 4. (County Treasurer.) Amend section fifty-two hun-

2 dred twenty-two (5222), code 1931, by striking from paragraph 

3 one (1), lines one (1) and two (2), the words "seventeen hundred" 

4 and substituting therefor the words "one thousand five hundred 

5 th i r ty . " 

6 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

7 two (2), line two (2), the words "eighteen hundred" and substi-

8 tuting therefor the words "one thousand six hundred twenty." 

9 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

10 three (3), line two (2), the words "nineteen hundred" and sub-

11 stituting therefor the words ' ' one thousand seven hundred ten. ' ' 

12 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

13 four (4), line two (2), the words " two thousand" and substituting 



— 4 — 

14 therefor the words "eighteen hundred." 

15 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

16 five (5), line two (2), the words "twenty-one hundred" and sub-

17 stituting therefor the words "one thousand eight hundred thirty-

18 five." 

19 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

20 six (6), line two (2), the words "twenty-two hundred" and sub-

21 stituting therefor the words "one thousand eight hundred seventy." 

22 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

23 seven (7), line two (2), the words "twenty-four hundred" and sub-

24 stituting therefor the words " two thousand forty." 

25 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

26 eight (8), line two (2), the words "twenty-eight hundred" and sub-

27 stituting therefor the words " two thousand four hundred eighty." 

28 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

29 nine (9), line two (2), the words "three thousand fifty dollars" 

30 and substituting therefor the words " two thousand five hundred 

31 ninety-two dollars and fifty cents." 

32 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

33 ten (10), line two, the words "thirty-three hundred" and sub-

34 stituting therefor the words " two thousand eight hundred five." 

35 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

36 eleven (11), lines one (1) and two (2), the words "thirty-four 

37 hundred" and substituting therefor the words " two thousand eight 

38 hundred ninety." 

1 Sec. 5. (Deputy Treasurer and Clerk.) Amend section fifty-two 



— 5 — 

2 hundred twenty-three (5223), code 1931, by striking from paragraph 

3 one (1), line three (3), the words "fifteen hundred" and substi-

4 tuting therefor the words "fourteen hundred." 

5 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

6 two (2), lines four (4) and five (5), the words "one thousand 

7 seven hundred fifty" and substituting therefor the words "one 

8 thousand five hundred seventy-five." 

9 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

10 two (2), line ten (10), the words "fifteen hundred" and substi-

11 tuting therefor the words "fourteen hundred." 

1 Sec. 6. (County Recorder.) Amend section fifty-two hun-

2 dred twenty-four (5224), code 1931, by striking from paragraph 

3 one (1), lines one (1) and two (2), the words "sixteen hundred" 

4 and substituting therefor the words "one thousand four hundred 

5 for ty." 

6 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

7 two (2), line two (2), the words "seventeen hundred" and substi-

8 tuting therefor the words "one thousand five hundred th i r ty . " 

9 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

10 three (3), line two (2), the words "eighteen hundred" and substi-

11 tuting therefor the words "one thousand six hundred twenty." 

12 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

13 four (4), line two (2), the words "nineteen hundred" and substi-

14 tuting therefor the words "one thousand seven hundred t en . " 

15 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

16 five (5), line two (2), the words " two thousand" and substitut-



— 6 — 

17 ing therefor the words "eighteen hundred." 

18 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

19 six (6), line two (2), the words "twenty-one hundred" and substi-

20 tuting therefor the words "one thousand eight hundred thirty-

21 five." 

22 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

23 seven (7), line two (2), the words "twenty-two hundred" and sub-

24 stituting therefor the words ' ' one thousand eight hundred seventy.' r 

25 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

26 eight (8), line two (2), the words "twenty-three hundred" and sub-

27 stituting therefor the words "one thousand nine hundred fifty-

28 five." 

29 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

30 nine (9), line two (2), the words "twenty-four hundred" and sub-

31 stituting therefor the words " two thousand forty." 

32 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

33 ten (10), line two (2), the words "twenty-eight hundred" and sub-

34 stituting therefor the words " two thousand four hundred eighty." 

35 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

36 eleven (11), lines one (1) and two (2), the words "thirty-one hun-

37 dred" and substituting therefor the words " two thousand six hun-

38 dred thirty-five." 

1 Sec. 7. (Deputy Recorder and Clerk.) Amend section fifty-

2 two hundred twenty-five (5225), code 1931, by striking from 

3 paragraph one (1), line three (3), the words "fifteen hundred" 

4 and substituting therefor the words "fourteen hundred." 



— 7 — 

5 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

6 two (2), lines four (4) and five (5), the words "one thousand 

7 seven hundred fifty'' and substituting therefor the words "one 

8 thousand five hundred seventy-five.'' 

9 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

10 two (2), line ten (10), the words "fifteen hundred" and substi-

11 tuting therefor the words, "fourteen hundred." 

1 Sec. 8. (County Sheriff.) Amend section fifty-two hundred 

2 twenty-six (5226), code 1931, by striking from paragraph one 

3 (1), lines one (1) and two (2), the words "seventeen hundred 

4 and substituting therefor the words "one thousand five hundred 

5 th i r ty . " 

6 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

7 two (2), line two (2), the words "eighteen hundred" and substi-

8 tuting therefor the words 4 k one thousand six hundred twenty. ' ' 

9 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

10 three (3), line two (2). the words "nineteen hundred" and sub-

11 stituting therefor the words "one thousand seven hundred ten ." 

12 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

13 four (4), line two (2), the words " two thousand" and substituting 

14 therefor the wrords "eighteen hundred." 

15 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

16 five (5), line two (2), the words "twenty-one hundred" and sub-

17 stituting therefor the words "one thousand eight hundred thirty-

18 five." 

19 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 



— 8 — 

20 six (6), line two (2), the words "twenty-two hundred" and sub-

21 stituting therefor the words "one thousand eight hundred seventy'7 

22 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

23 seven (7), line two (2), the words "twenty-four hundred" and sub-

24 stituting therefor the words " two thousand forty." 

25 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

26 eight (8), line two (2), the words "twenty-six hundred" and sub-

27 stituting therefor the words " two thousand two hundred ten ." 

28 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

29 nine (9), line two (2), the words "twenty-eight hundred" and sub-

30 stituting therefor the words " two thousand four hundred eighty." 

31 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

32 ten (10), line two (2), the words "thirty-five hundred and sub-

33 stituting therefor the words " two thousand nine hundred seventy-

34 five." 

35 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

36 ten (10), line four (4), the words "five thousand" and substitut-

37 ing therefor the words "four thousand." 

1 Sec. 9. (Deputy Sheriff.) Amend section fifty-two hundred 

2 twenty-seven (5227), code 1931, by striking from paragraph one 

3 (1), line three (3), the words "fifteen hundred" and substituting 

4 therefor the words ' ' fourteen hundred. ' ' 

5 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

6 two (2), line five (5), the words "eighteen hundred" and substi-

7 tuting therefor the words "one thousand six hundred twenty." 

1 See. 10. (County Attorney.) Amend section fifty-two hun-



— 9 — 

2 dred twenty-eight X5228), code 1931, by striking from paragraph 

3 one (1), lines one (1) and two (2), the words "eleven hundred 

4 dollars" and substituting therefor the words "one thousand 

5 seventeen dollars and fifty cents." 

6 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

7 two (2), line two (2), the words "fourteen hundred" and substi-

8 tuting therefor the words "one thousand two hundred ninety-five." 

9' Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

10 three (3), line two (2), the words "sixteen hundred" and substi-

11 tuting therefor the words "one thousand four hundred forty." 

12 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

13 four (4), line two (2), the words "seventeen hundred" and sub-

14 stituting therefor the words "one thousand five hundred th i r ty ." 

15 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

16 five (5), line two (2), the words " two thousand" and substituting 

17 therefor the words "one thousand eight hundred." 

18 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

19 six (6), line two (2), the words "twenty-two hundred" and substi-

20 tuting therefor the words "one thousand eight hundred seventy." 

21 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

22 seven (7), line two (2), the words "twenty-five hundred" and sub-

23 stituting therefor the words " two thousand one hundred twenty-

24 five." 

25 Further amend said section by striking from* paragraph 

26 eight (8), line two (2), the words "thirty-five hundred" and sub-

27 stituting therefor the words " two thousand nine hundred seventy-



— 10 — 

28 five." 

29 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph nine 

30 (9), line two (2), the words "four thousand" and substituting there-

31 for the words "three thousand two hundred." 

32 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

33 ten (10), lines one (1) and two (2), the words "five thousand" 

34 and substituting therefor the words "four thousand." 

1 Sec. 11. (Assistant County Attorney.) Amend section fifty-

2 two hundred twenty-nine (5229), code 1931, by striking from para-

3 graph two (2), line two (2), the words "one thousand" and substi-

4 tuting therefor the words "nine hundred sixty." 

5 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

6 three (3), line two (2), the words "fifteen hundred" and substi-

7 tuting therefor the words "one thousand four hundred." 

8 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

9 four (4), line two (2), the words " two thousand" and substituting 

10 therefor the words "one thousand eie*ht hundred." 

11 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

12 five (5), line two (2), the words "twenty-five hundred" and sub-

13 stituting therefor the words " two thousand one hundred twenty-

14 five." 

15 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

16 six (6), lines ten (10) and eleven (11), the words " two thousand" 

17 and substituting therefor the words "eighteen hundred." 

1 Sec. 12. (Clerk of Court.) Amend section fifty-two hundred 

2 thirty (5230), code 1931, by striking from paragraph one (1), 



— 11 — 

3 lines one (1) and two (2), the words "seventeen hundred ' ' and 

4 substituting therefor the words "one thousand five hundred 

5 th i r ty . " 

6 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

7 two (2), line two (2), the words "eighteen hundred" and substi-

8 tuting therefor the words "one thousand six hundred twenty." 

9 Further amend said section by striking from para-

10 graph three (3), line two (2), the words "nineteen hundred" and 

11 substituting therefor the words "one thousand seven hundred 

12 t e n . " , 

13 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

14 four (4), line two (2), the words " two thousand" and substituting 

15 therefor the words "eighteen hundred." 

16 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

17 five (5), line two (2), the words "twenty-one hundred" and sub-

18 stituting therefor the words "one thousand eight hundred thirty-

19 five." 

20 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

21 six (6), line two (2), the words "twenty-two hundred" and substi-

22 tuting therefor the words "one thousand eight hundred seventy." 

23 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

24 seven (7), line two (2), the words "twenty-four hundred" and sub-

25 stituting therefor the words " two thousand forty." 

26 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

27 eight (8), line two (2), the words "twenty-eight hundred1 ' and sub-

28 stituting therefor the words " two thousand four hundred eighty." 



— 12 — 

29 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

30 nine (9), line two (2), the words ' ' three thousand fifty dollars" 

31 and substituting therefor the words " two thousand five hundred 

32 ninety-two dollars and fifty cents." 

33 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

34 ten (10), line two (2), the words "thirty-three hundred" and 

35 substituting therefor the words " two thousand eight hundred five." 

36 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

37 eleven (11), lines one (1) and two (2), the words "thirty-four 

38 hundred" and substituting therefor the words " two thousand eight 

39 hundred ninety." 

1 Sec. 13. (Deputy Clerk.) Amend section fifty-two hundred 

2 thirty-one (5231), code 1931, by striking from paragraph one 

3 (1), line three (3), the words "firteen hundred" and substituting 

4 therefor the words "fourteen hundred." 

5 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

6 two (2), lines four (4) and five (5), the words "one thousand 

7 seven hundred fifty" and substituting therefor the words "one 

8 thousand five hundred seventy-five." 

9 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

10 two (2), line ten (10), the words "fifteen hundred" and substi-

11 tuting therefor the words "fourteen hundred." 

1 Sec. 14. (County Superintendent.) Amend section fifty-two 

2 hundred thirty-two (5232), code 1931, by striking from line 

3 three (3) the words "eighteen hundred" and substituting there-

4 for the words "one thousand six hundred twenty." 



— 13 — 

5 Further amend said section by striking from lines 

6 six (6) and seven (7), the words " three thousand' ' and substi-

7 tuting therefor the words 'i two thousand five hundred fifty.'' 

1 Sec. 15. (Compensation of Township Trustees.) Amend sec-

2 tion fifty-five hundred seventy-one (5571), code 1931, by 

3 striking from paragraph one (1), line three (3), the words 

4 "four dol lars" and substituting therefor the words " two dol-

5 lars and fifty cents. ' ' 

6 Further amend said section by striking from paragraph 

7 one (1), line six (6), the words "four dollars," and substituting 

8 therefor the words " two dollars and fifty cents." 

1 Sec. 16. (Compensation of Township Clerks.) Amend section 

2 fifty-five hundred seventy-two (572), code 1931, by striking 

3 from paragraph one (1), lines four (4) and five (5), the words 

4 "four dol lars" and substituting the words " two dollars 

5 and fifty cents." 

1 Sec. 17. (Compensation of Assessors.) Amend section fifty-

2 five hundred seventy-three (5573), code 1931, by striking from 

3 line six (6), the words "four dol lars" and substituting therefor 

4 "the words " three dollars." 

5 Further amend said section by striking from line thirteen 

6 (13), the words "four dol lars" and substituting therefor the words 

7 " three dollars." 

1 Sec. 18. (Compensation of Assessors and Deputies.) Amend 

2 section fifty-^six hundred sixty-nine (5669), code 1931, by strik-

3 ing from line nine (9) the words "eighteen hundred" and sub-



— 14 — 

4 stituting therefor the words "one thousand six hundred twenty. ' ' 

5 Further amend said section by striking from line eleven 

6 (11) the words "eighteen hundred" and substituting therefor the 

7 words "one thousand six hundred twenty." 

8 Further amend said section by striking from line twelve 

9 (12) the word "f ive" and substituting therefor the word " four . " 

10 Further amend said section by striking from line fifteen 

11 (15) the word "f ive" and substituting therefor the word " f o u r ; " 

12 and by striking from lines fifteen (15) and sixteen (16) the words 

13 "and fifty cents." 

14 Further amend said section by striking from lines twenty-

15 four (24) and twenty-five (25), the words "twenty-five hundred" 

16 and substituting therefor the words " two thousand one hundred 

17 twenty-five." 

18 Further amend said section by striking from line twenty-

19 seven (27) the words "eighteen hundred" and substituting there-

20 for the words "one thousand six hundred twenty." 

1 Sec. 19. That all statutory salaries be reduced as follows : 

2 All salary rates of one thousand dollars ($1,000) per year 

3 and under shall be reduced five (5) per cent. 

4 All salary rates of one thousand one dollar ($1,001) per 

5 year and less than one thousand five hundred and one dollars 

6 ($1,501) per year shall be reduced seven and one-half (7%) per 

7 cent but shall not be reduced to less than nine hundred sixty 

8 dollars ($960) per year. 

9 All salary rates of one thousand five hundred and one 



— 15 — 

10 dollars ($1,501) per year and less than two thousand and one 

11 dollars ($2,001) per year shall be reduced ten (10) per cent, 

12 but shall not be reduced to less than one thousand four hun-

13 dred dollars ($1,400) per year. 

14 All salary rates of two thousand and one dollars ($2,001) 

15 per year and less than three thousand six hundred and one 

16 dollars ($3,601) per year shall be reduced fifteen (15) per cent 

17 but shall not be reduced to less than one thousand eight hundred 

18 thirty-five dollars ($1,835) per year. 

19 All salary rates of three thousand six hundred and one 

20 dollars ($3,601) per year and less than five thousand and one 

21 dollars ($5,001) per year shall be reduced twenty (20) per cent 

22 but shall not be reduced to less than three thousand one hun-

23 dred dollars ($3,100) per year. 

24 All salary rates of five thousand and one dollar ($5,001) 

25 per year and over shall be reduced twenty-five (25) per cent, 

26 but shall not be reduced to less than four thousand one hundred 

27 dollars ($4,100) per year. 

1 Sec. 20. That all provisions of the code 1931 and laws of 

2 the Forty-fourth (44th) General Assembly, relating to salaries be 

3 amended, revised and codified in accordance herewith. 

1 Sec. 21. All acts or parts of acts in conflict with the 

2 provisions hereof are hereby repealed. 


	HF 0021 SF 0021_Page 0001
	HF 0021 SF 0021_Page 0002
	HF 0021 SF 0021_Page 0003
	HF 0021 SF 0021_Page 0004
	HF 0021 SF 0021_Page 0005
	HF 0021 SF 0021_Page 0006
	HF 0021 SF 0021_Page 0007
	HF 0021 SF 0021_Page 0008
	HF 0021 SF 0021_Page 0009
	HF 0021 SF 0021_Page 0010
	HF 0021 SF 0021_Page 0011
	HF 0021 SF 0021_Page 0012
	HF 0021 SF 0021_Page 0013
	HF 0021 SF 0021_Page 0014
	HF 0021 SF 0021_Page 0015

