229
CH. 175] LAWS OF THE FIFTY-SEVENTH GENERAL ASSEMBLY

CHAPTER 173
USE OF REAL ESTATE BY COUNTY
H. F. 506

AN ACT to allow county supervisors to acquire the use of real estate for county pur-
pose by means other than purchase.

Be It Enacted by the General Assembly of the State of Iowa:

1 SECTION 1. Section three hundred thirty-two point three (332.3),
2 Code 1954, is amended by inserting in line one (1) of subsection twelve
3 (12) after the word “purchase” the words “or acquire tltle or posses-
4 sion by lease or otherwise”.

Approved April 25, 1957.

CHAPTER 174
WITNESS FEES IN JURY TRIALS
S. F. 198

AN ACT relating to payment of witness fees in jury trials in the district courts in
criminal cases.

Be It Enacted by the General Assembly of the State of Iowa:

SECTION 1. Section three hundred thirty-three point three (333.3),
Code 1954, is amended by striking from line two (2) of subsection
three (3) the words, “of trial jury” and inserting in lieu thereof the
words, “in jury trials”.

Approved March 27, 1957.

Lo D

CHAPTER 175
COMPENSATION OF COUNTY OFFICERS
S. F. 234

AN ACT to amend chapter one hundred seventy-three (173), Acts of the Fifty-sixth
General Assembly, relating to the compensation of county officers.

Be It Enacted by the General Assembly of the State of Iowa:

1 SECTION 1. Section one (1) of chapter one hundred seventy-three
2 (173), Acts of the Fifty-sixth General Assembly, is hereby amended
3 by striking therefrom subsections one (1) to thirteen (18), inclusive,
4 and inserting in lieu thereof the following:

5 | “l. Less than ten thousand (10,000), four thousand (4,000) dol-
6 lars.

7 2. Ten thousand (10,000) and less than fifteen thousand (15,000),
8 four thousand one hundred fifty (4,150) dollars.

9 3. Fifteen thousand (15,000) and less than twenty thousand (20,-
0 000), four thousand three hundred (4,300) dollars.

1

1
1 4. Twenty thousand (20,000) and less than twenty-five thousand



230
LAWS OF THE FIFTY-SEVENTH GENERAL ASSEMBLY [CH. 175

—
SOR-JDU WD

b bk e ok
T GO DO

it el
W O0-IN

[NCR AN AV )
WN O

DO DN
S OUk

Do DN
e SlEN|

LW
o

1
2

(25,000), four thousand four hundred fifty (4,450) dollars.

5. Twenty-five thousand (25,000) and less than thirty thousand
(30,000), four thousand six hundred (4,600) dollars.

6. Thirty thousand (30,000) and less than thirty-five thousand
(35,000), four thousand seven hundred fifty (4,750) dollars.

7. Thirty-five thousand (35,000) and less than forty thousand
(40,000), four thousand nine hundred (4,900) dollars.

8. Forty thousand (40,000) and less than forty-five thousand (45,-
000), five thousand fifty (5,050) dollars.

9. Forty-five thousand (45,000) and less than fifty thousand (50,-
000), five thousand two hundred (5,200) dollars.

10. Fifty thousand (50,000) and less than sixty thousand (60,000),
five thousand five hundred (5,500) dollars.

11. Sixty thousand (60,000) and less than seventy thousand (70,-
000), five thousand eight hundred (5,800) dollars.

12. Seventy thousand (70,000) and less than eighty thousand (80,-
000), six thousand one hundred (6,100) dollars.

13. Eighty thousand (80,000) and over, six thousand four hundred
(6,400) dollars.”

SEC. 2. Section two (2) of chapter one hundred seventy-three
(173), Acts of the Fifty-sixth General Assembly, is hereby amended
by striking therefrom subsections one (1) to fourteen (14), inclusive,
and inserting in lieu thereof the following:

“1. Less than ten thousand (10,000), four thousand (4,000) dollars.

2. Ten thousand (10,000) and less than fifteen thousand (15,000),
four thousand one hundred fifty (4,150) dollars.

3. Fifteen thousand (15,000) and less than twenty thousand (20,-
000), four thousand three hundred (4,300) dollars.

4. Twenty thousand (20,000) and less than twenty-five thousand
(25,000), four thousand four hundred fifty (4,450) dollars.

5. Twenty-five thousand (25,000) and less than thirty thousand
(30,000), four thousand six hundred (4,600) dollars.

6. Thirty thousand (30,000) and less than thirty-five thousand
(35,000), four thousand seven hundred fifty (4,750) dollars.

7. Thirty-five thousand (35,000) and less than forty thousand
(40,000), four thousand nine hundred (4,900) dollars.

8. Forty thousand (40,000) and less than forty-five thousand (45,-
000), five thousand fifty (5,050) dollars.

9. Forty-five thousand (45,000) and less than fifty thousand (50,-
000), five thousand two hundred (5,200) dollars.

10. Fifty thousand (50,000) and less than sixty thousand (60,000),
five thousand five hundred (5,500) dollars.

11. Sixty thousand (60,000) and less than seventy thousand (70,-
000), five thousand eight hundred (5,800) dollars.

12. Seventy thousand (70,000) and less than eighty thousand (80,-
000), six thousand one hundred (6,100) dollars.

13. Eighty thousand (80,000) and less than one hundred twenty-
five thousand (125,000) six thousand six hundred (6,600) dollars.

14. One hundred twenty-five thousand (125,000) and over, seven
thousand six hundred (7,600) dollars.”

SEC. 3. Section four (4) of chapter one hundred seventy-three
(173), Acts of the Fifty-sixth General Assembly, is hereby amended



Q
m

231

. 175] LAWS OF THE FIFTY-SEVENTH GENERAL ASSEMBLY

€9 0O 09 0O 0O DO DY DD DO D DD BN DD D DY -t 1=t 1t b o ok ek ok ot fok ok ok ek
O W RO OOR TSRO AN m SOOI OO0 -ITD TR I - Ol 00 1O — O O 00 ~1 S T &9

by striking from line four (4) thereof the word “eleven” and insert-
ing in lieu thereof the words “twelve dollars and fifty cents ($12.50)”;
by striking from lines five (5) and six (6) the words “thirty-six hun-
dred” and inserting in lieu thereof the words “four thousand (4,000)”;
by striking from lines seven (7) and eight (8) the words ‘“four thou-
sand” and inserting in lieu thereof the words “four thousand four
hundred (4 400)”; by strlklng from line nine (9) the words “five
thousand” and inserting in lieu thereof the words ‘“five thousand four
hundred (5,400)”; by striking from line eleven (11) the words “fifty-
eight hundred” and inserting in lieu thereof the words “six thousand.
two hundred (6,200)”; by striking from line fourteen (14) the words
“fifty-two hundred” and inserting in lieu thereof the words “fifty-six
hundred (5,600)”.

SEC. 4. Section six (6) of chapter one hundred seventy-three
(173), Acts of the Fifty-sixth General Assembly, is hereby amended
by striking therefrom subsections one (1) to fifteen (15), inclusive,
and inserting in lieu thereof the following:

“l. Less than ten thousand (10,000), three thousand two hundred
(3,200) dollars.

2. Ten thousand (10,000) and less than fifteen thousand (15,000),
three thousand three hundred fifty (3,350) dollars.

3. Fifteen thousand (15,000) and less than twenty thousand (20,-
000), three thousand five hundred (3,500) dollars.

4. Twenty thousand (20,000) and less than twenty-five thousand
(25,000), three thousand six hundred fifty (3,650) dollars.

5. Twenty-five thousand (25,000) and less than thirty thousand
(30,000), three thousand eight hundred (3,800) dollars.

6. Thirty thousand (30,000) and less than thirty-five thousand
(35,000), three thousand nine hundred fifty (38,950) dollars.

7. Thirty-five thousand (35,000) and less than forty thousand (40,-
000), four thousand one hundred (4,100) dollars.

8. Forty thousand (40,000) and less than forty-five thousand (45,-
000), four thousand two hundred fifty (4,250) dollars.

9. Forty-five thousand (45,000) and less than fifty thousand (50 -
000), four thousand four hundred (4,400) dollars.

10. Fifty thousand (50,000) and less than sixty thousand (60,000),
four thousand seven hundred (4,700) dollars.

11. Sixty thousand (60,000) and less than seventy thousand (70,-
000), five thousand eight hundred (5,800) dollars.

12, Seventy thousand (70,000) and less than eighty thousand (80,-
000), six thousand one hundred (6,100) dollars.

13. Eighty thousand (80,000) and less than one hundred thousand
(100,000), six thousand gix hundred (6,600) dollars.

14. One hundred thousand (100,000) and less than one hundred
fifty thousand (150,000), seven thousand two hundred (7,200) dollars.

15. One hundred fifty thousand (150,000) and over, seven thousand
gix hundred (7,600) dollars.”

SEC. 5. Section two hundred thirty-one point eight (231.8), Code
1954, as amended by the Acts of the Fifty-sixth General Assembly is
further amended as follows :

Subsection one (1) line five (5), strike “eight dollars per day or
one dollar per hour” and insert “twelve dollars per day or one dollar



232
LAWS OF THE FIFTY-SEVENTH GENERAL ASSEMBLY [CH. 175

=
= O 000 =] Ot GO DO

bk ok bk ekt bk ek
e 00=-3JC Uk N

and a half per hour”.

Subsection one (1), line seven (7), strike “twenty-nine hundred”
and insert “thirty-four hundred”.

Subsection two (2), line eight (8), strike “forty-four hundred” and
insert “forty-nine hundred”,

Subsection two (2), line twelve (12), strike “thirty-three hundred
twenty” and insert “thirty-eight hundred twenty”.

Subsection three (3), line five (5), strike “forty-nine hundred” and
ingert “fifty-four hundred”.

Subsection three (3), line nine (9), strike “thirty-nine hundred
twenty” and insert ‘“forty-four hundred twenty”.

Subsection four (4), line four (4), strike “fifty-eight hundred’” and
insert “sixty-three hundred”.

Subsection four (4), line eight (8), strike ‘“‘“forty-three hundred
twenty’’ and insert “forty-eight hundred twenty”.

Subsection five (5), line six (6), strike “twenty-two hundred” and
insert “twenty-seven hundred”.

Subsection five (5), lines nine (9) and ten (10), strike “twenty-
seven hundred” and insert “thirty-two hundred”.

Subsection six (6), line fifteen (15), strike “forty-six hundred” and
insert “fifty-one hundred”.

SEC. 6. Section five (5) of chapter one hundred seventy-three
(178), Acts of the Fifty-sixth General Assembly, is amended by add-
ing the following subsections:

“Section three hundred forty point two (340.2), Code 1954, is fur-
ther amended by striking the period (.) after the word ‘principal’
in line six (6) and inserting in lieu thereof the following: ‘; how-
ever, in counties with a population of one hundred thousand (100,000)
or more, first and second deputies, and any deputy in charge of the
motor vehicle registration and title department, shall receive an
annual salary of eighty (80) percent of his or her principal’

“Section three hundred forty point two (340.2), Code 1954, is fur-
ther amended by striking the period (.) at the end of line eleven (11)
and inserting in lieu thereof the following: ¢; however, in counties
with a population of one hundred thousand (100,000) or more,
deputies (where more than two (2) deputies are required) and the
first assistant to the deputy in charge of the motor vehicle registra-
tion and title department, shall receive an annual salary of gixty-five
(65) percent of their principal.’”

SEC. 7. This Act shall be in full force and effect on and after Jan-
vary 1, 1958.

Approved May 1, 1957.



