
167 
CH. 147] LAWS OF THE FIFTY-SIXTH GENERAL ASSEMBLY 

CHAPTER 146 
ERECTING AND REPAIRING SCHOOLHOUSES 

H. F. 28 

AN ACT to amend sections two hundred ninety-seven point seven (297.7) and two 
hundred ninety-seven point eight (297.8), Code 1954, relating to bids for erecting 
and repairing schoolhouses. 

Be It Enacted by the General Assembly of the State of Iowa: 

1 SECTION 1. Amend section two hundred ninety-seven point seven 
2 (297.7), Code 1954, by striking the words "one thousand" in line ten 
3 (10) and substituting in lieu thereof the words "twenty-five hundred". 

1 SEC. 2. Amend section two hundred ninety-seven point eight 
2 (297.8), Code 1954, by striking the words "one thousand" in line two 
3 (2) and substituting in lieu thereof the words "twenty-five hundred". 

Approved March 22, 1955. 

CHAPTER 147 
STATE TRAVELING LIBRARY 

H. F. 130 

AN ACT to amend chapter three hundred three (303), Code 1964, relating to the Iowa 
state traveling library. 

Be It Enacted by the General Assembly of the State of Iowa: 

1 SECTION 1. There is hereby established the Iowa state traveling 
2 library. 

1 SEC. 2. Board of Trustees. The Iowa state traveling library shall 
2 be under the control of a board of trustees of the state traveling 
3 library, herein referred to as the board, consisting of five (5) mem-
4 bers, none of whom shall be practicing librarians, to be appointed by 
5 the governor, three (3) of whom may be from a list of six (6) nomina-
6 tions submitted by the Iowa library association and one (1) chosen 
7 from a list of three (3) nominations submitted by the superintendent 
8 of public instruction. The first members appointed by the governor 
9 shall be appointed for terms of one (1), two (2), three (3), four (4) 

10 and five (5) years, and all subsequent appointments shall be for terms 
11 of five (5) years. Vacancies shall be filled in like manner for the re-
12 maining term. The board shall meet at least once in each quarter of 
13 each fiscal year to transact business and shall at the first meeting of 
14 the new year elect a chairman from said board. 

1 SEC. 3 The powers and duties of the board shall be: 
2 1. To make and enforce rules for the keeping of the records and for 
3 the management and care of the property of the Iowa state traveling 
4 library. 
5 2. To give advice and counsel to all public libraries in the state and 
6 to all political subdivisions which may propose to establish libraries. 
7 3. To print such lists and circulars of information and instruction 
8 as it shall deem necessary. 

Digitized by Coogle 


